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Sexual misdemeanours in high places are not new. Today's tabloid headlines of passion and indignation at
the behaviour of members of the royal and political establishment are paralleled by events of a century and
more ago. The mid-Victorian period was dominated by a double standard which insisted on a rigid public
respectability while condoning widespread sexual immorality by men. This hypocrisy led to extensive
protests culminating in a series of highly publicized scandals in the 1880s and '90s which marked the
triumph of dogmatic puritanical morality. A furious controversy raged during the 1860s and '70s over
stealthy moves towards legalizing prostitution. One MP commented on the protest movement, in which early
feminists such as Florence Nightingale and Josephine Butler featured prominently, 'We know how to manage
any other opposition . . . but this is very awkward for us - this revolt of women. It is quite a new thing.' The
general public often reacted violently to the protesters; on one occasion a mob threatened to burn down the
hotel where Josephine Butler was staying. Nevertheless, the remainder of the nineteenth century saw the
inexorable rise to a position of power and influence of the 'purity lobby', assisted by the major scandals of the
period, which saw the downfall of Sir Charles Dilke, Charles Stewart Parnell and, most infamously of all,
Oscar Wilde. This is a fascinating analysis of the politics of sexual morality in Victorian Britain, which not
only provides a well-researched and radical new view of the period, but also raises many questions about the
extent to which the Victorian period can be described as the rise of respectable society.
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From reader reviews:

Irving Wile:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you will want this Scandal: The Sexual Politics of Late Victorian Britain.

Cheree Rodriquez:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Scandal: The Sexual Politics of Late Victorian Britain.
You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a
book Scandal: The Sexual Politics of Late Victorian Britain. You can add knowledge and of course you can
around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your
country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we can open a book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can use it
when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Wesley Binns:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn
a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, along with
soon. The Scandal: The Sexual Politics of Late Victorian Britain offer you a new experience in reading a
book.

Dallas Richardson:

This Scandal: The Sexual Politics of Late Victorian Britain is new way for you who has interest to look for
some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you
know or else you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Scandal: The Sexual Politics of Late
Victorian Britain can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is easy to
get by means of anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yeah I
mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy
this publication is the answer. So there is not any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book variety for your
better life and also knowledge.
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