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The fifth book in the OMEGA series! War is a violent thing, but sometimes inevitable. Both sides suffer.
When allies become enemies, and enemies become allies, who do you trust? Sides must be taken. Lives will
be lost.

Also available from this author:

SODIUM Series

A six-book series that takes Man from his first encounter with aliens all the way to a fight for our all-out
survival. Do we have what it takes to rule the galaxy?

AMP Series

Cast a thousand years into the future beyond SODIUM. This eight-book series chronicles the struggles of
Don Grange, a simple package deliveryman, who is thrust into an unimaginable role in the fight against our
enemies. Can we win peace and freedom after a thousand years of war?

OMEGA Series

Cast a thousand years into the future beyond AMP. The Alliance is crumbling. When corruption and politics
threaten to throw the allied galaxies into chaos, Knog Beutcher gets caught in the middle. Follow along as
our hero is thrust into roles that he never expected or sought. Espionage, intrigue, political assassinations,
rebellions and full-on revolutions, they are all coming to Knog Beutcher's world!

HADRON Series

HADRON is a modern day story unrelated to the SODIUM-AMP-OMEGA trilogy series. After scientists
using the Large Hadron Collider discover dark matter, the world is plunged into chaos. Massive waves of
electromagnetic interference take out all grid power and forms of communication the world over. Cities go
dark, food and water supplies are quickly used up, and marauders rule the highways. One group of citizens
takes a stand. Can they make a difference? And the devastating EM waves, where are they coming from?
After months of starvation, a benevolent species arrive in their spaceships to rescue the Human race. Only,
are they really so benevolent?

ARMS Series

ARMS is set in the future after Earth was nearing an apocalyptic event. Two competing colony ships were
built, taking five million inhabitants each through a wormhole to a pair of newly discovered planets. The
planets were settled and not long after the colonies looked to the surrounding star systems for ownership and
expansion, which led to a centuries long war between them. A truce was declared after the aggressor side
began to lose ground.

Tawnish Freely and Harris Gruberg are genetically engineered Biomarines. Their lives have been dedicated



to fighting the war. They find themselves struggling to find work among a population that fears them. Work
is found only by delving into the delivery of illegal arms to the outer colonies. Things go awry when they
discover their illicit dealings may just be the catalyst that brings back the Great War. They are determined to
prevent that from happening.
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From reader reviews:

Howard Kincaid:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled OMEGA Hostile. Try to stumble through book OMEGA
Hostile as your buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside associated
with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we need to make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Luann Bowen:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a reserve. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book OMEGA Hostile will make you
to be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of
you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they may be
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or ideal book with you?

Brian Robinson:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know which one you should start with. This OMEGA Hostile
is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

James Butler:

The book untitled OMEGA Hostile contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with
easy technique. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not necessarily worry,
you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author brings you in the new
era of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or
product, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-
book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.
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